
Item No. Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension

18-001-00 - LS Insurance and Bonding 7,000.00$                 7,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 24,000.00$              - 21,000.00$              21,000.00$              - - - - - -

18-001-01 - LS Mobilization 17,500.00$              17,500.00$              10,000.00$              10,000.00$              10,000.00$              - 19,000.00$              19,000.00$              - - - - - -

18-001-02 - LS Traffic Control 7,500.00$                 7,500.00$                 2,000.00$                 2,000.00$                 7,500.00$                 - 15,000.00$              15,000.00$              - - - - - -

18-001-03 - LS Surface Preparation & Sweeping 7,500.00$                 7,500.00$                 2,500.00$                 2,500.00$                 5,000.00$                 - 5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 - - - - - -

18-001-04 1,178,446 SF
One-Course Surface Treatment (Application of Asphalt 

Emulsion and Aggregate Embedding) (Broken down below):
- - - - - -

18-001-04a 6,160 SF
Circle A Trl. from its intersection with Bandera Rd. to its 

intersection with Bar X Trl.
0.21$                         1,293.60$                 0.31$                         1,909.60$                 1.05$                         6,468.00$                 0.22$                         1,355.20$                 - - - - - -

18-001-04b 471,473 SF

Lazy F Trl., Flying W Trl., Diamond K Trl., Rocking M Trl., Bar D 

Trl., Cross XD Trl., Laurel Leaf, Circle B Trl., Circle E Trl., Circle C 

Trl., and Rafter O Trl., in their entirety

0.21$                         99,009.33$              0.31$                         146,156.63$            0.28$                         132,012.44$            0.22$                         103,724.06$            - - - - - -

18-001-04c 30,936 SF Sunset Ranch and Baxtershire 0.21$                         6,496.56$                 0.31$                         9,590.16$                 0.38$                         11,755.68$              0.22$                         6,805.92$                 - - - - - -

18-001-04d 147,960 SF Evans Valley Subdivision, in its entirety 0.21$                         31,071.60$              0.31$                         45,867.60$              0.29$                         42,908.40$              0.22$                         32,551.20$              - - - - - -

18-001-04e 486,458 SF Helotes Ranch Acres Subdivision, Unit No. 4, in its entirety 0.21$                         102,156.18$            0.31$                         150,801.98$            0.27$                         131,343.66$            0.22$                         107,020.76$            - - - - - -

18-001-04f 21,639 SF Saltillo Flat and Alta Tierra, in their entirety 0.21$                         4,544.19$                 0.31$                         6,708.09$                 0.45$                         9,737.55$                 0.22$                         4,760.58$                 - - - - - -

18-001-04g 13,820 SF Alta Loma, in its entirety 0.21$                         2,902.20$                 0.31$                         4,284.20$                 0.56$                         7,739.20$                 0.22$                         3,040.40$                 - - - - - -

18-001-04(a-g) 1,178,466 SF One-Course Surface Treatment Total: 0.21$                         247,477.86$            - 384,818.26$            0.29$                         341,755.14$            - 259,262.52$            - - - - - -

18-001-05 - LS
Sweeping, Not to Exceed Thirty (30) Days After Application of 

One- and Two-Course Surface Treatments 
5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 3,000.00$                 3,000.00$                 2,500.00$                 - 10,000.00$              10,000.00$              - - - - - -

Mill and Overlay (Type D 4”) Surface Treatment; Vulcan 

Materials has pledged to the City to donate approximately 

350 tons of Dense Graded Hot Mix Asphalt for this phase of 

work.

- - - - - -

(Broken down below): - - - - - -

18-001-06a 10,158 SF
Rainbow Ridge from its intersection with Leslie Rd. to its 

intersection with Signal Hill
1.00$                         10,158.00$              3.95$                         40,124.10$              2.58$                         26,207.64$              3.00$                         30,474.00$              - - - - - -

18-001-06(a) 10,158 SF Mill and Overlay (Type D 4”) Surface Treatment Total: 1.00$                         10,158.00$              3.95$                         40,124.10$              2.58$                         26,207.64$              - 30,474.00$              - - - - - -

18-001-07 38,059 SF
Two-Course Surface Treatment (Application of Asphalt 

Emulsion and Aggregate Embedding) (Broken down below):
- - - - - - - -

18-001-07a 38,059 SF Old Scenic Loop Rd., in its entirety 0.68$                         25,880.12$              1.10$                         41,864.90$              0.46$                         17,507.14$              0.60$                         22,835.40$              - - - - - -

18-001-07 (a) 38,059 SF Two-Course Surface Treatment Total: 0.68$                         25,880.12$              1.10$                         41,864.90$              0.46$                         17,507.14$              - 22,835.40$              - - - - - -

18-001-08 500 TON Level Up Material (TxDOT Specifications for Item No. 341) 105.00$                    52,500.00$              187.39$                    93,695.00$              210.00$                    105,000.00$            90.00$                      45,000.00$              - - - - - -

Base Bid

Alternate No. 1

Alternate No. 2

Andale Construction Interstate Barricades & Markings, Inc.

City of Helotes 2018 Street Improvement Projects

18-001-06 10,158 SF

One-Course, Two Course, and Mill & Overlay Project Fuquay, Inc. Clark Construction of Texas, Inc. JP Paving Co, Inc. Wagner Materials & Construction

Alternate No. 1

Alternate No. 2

Total Bid

302,133.86$                                                   

25,880.12$                                                     

52,500.00$                                                     

427,942.36$                                                   

40,124.10$                                                     

93,695.00$                                                     

368,172.57$                                                   

17,507.14$                                                     

105,000.00$                                                   

359,736.52$                                                   

22,835.40$                                                     

45,000.00$                                                     

No bid No bid

TRP Construction Group, LLC

No bid



Item No. Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension

10-002-00 - LS Insurance and Bonding - - 5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 - - - - 8,906.32$                 8,906.32$                 - - - -

18-001-01 - LS Mobilization - - 10,000.00$              10,000.00$              - - - - 35,664.00$              35,664.00$              - - - -

18-001-02 - LS Traffic Control - - 2,000.00$                 2,000.00$                 - - - - 21,026.00$              21,026.00$              - - - -

18-001-03 - LS Surface Preparation - - 2,500.00$                 2,500.00$                 - - - - 4,520.00$                 4,520.00$                 - - - -

18-001-04 2,322,422 SF Mastic Surface Treatment (Broken down below): - - - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04a 471,473 SF

Lazy F Trl., Flying W Trl., Diamond K Trl.,

Rocking M Trl., Bar D Trl., Cross XD Trl.,

Laurel Leaf, Circle B Trl., Circle E Trl.,

Circle C Trl., and Rafter O Trl., in their

- - 0.21$                         99,009.33$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04b 180,965 SF Rafter S Trl. and Marnoch, in their entirety - - 0.21$                         38,002.65$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04c 586,956 SF Beverly Hills Subdivision, in its entirety - - 0.21$                         123,260.76$            - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04d 172,384 SF Hunters Ridge Subdivision, in its entirety - - 0.21$                         36,200.64$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04e 486,458 SF Helotes Ranch Acres Subdivision, in its entirety - - 0.21$                         102,156.18$            - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04h 21,639 SF Saltillo Flat and Alta Tierra, in their entirety - - 0.21$                         4,544.19$                 - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04i 13,820 SF Alta Loma, in its entirety - - 0.21$                         2,902.20$                 - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04j 246,607 SF

Leslie Rd. from its intersection with Bandera Rd. to its 

intersection with Rainbow Ridge; Rainbow Ridge from its 

intersection with Leslie Rd. to its intersection with Signal Hill; 

and Signal Hill, in its entirety

- - 0.21$                         51,787.47$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04k 142,120 SF
Scenic Loop Rod. From its intersection with Bandera Rd. to its 

intersection with Whip-O-Will Way
- - 0.21$                         29,845.20$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-04(a-k) 2,322,422 SF Mastic Surface Treatment Total: - - 507,208.62$            - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-05 170,391 SF Circle A Trl., in its entirety - - 0.21$                         35,782.11$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-06 159,395 SF Bar X Trl., in its entirety - - 0.21$                         33,472.95$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-07 38,509 SF Old Scenic Loop Rd., in its entirety - - 0.21$                         8,086.89$                 - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-08 147,833 SF Evans Valley Subdivision, in its entirety - - 0.21$                         31,044.93$              - - - - - - - - - -

18-002-09 2,322,422 SF
Substitute High Density Mineral Bond (HA5) for specified 

mastic surface treatment for Item Nos. 18-002-04 (a-k) Total:
- - No Bid No Bid - - - - 0.32$                         664,260.80$            - - - -

18-002-10 516,128 SF

Substitute High Density Mineral Bond (HA5) for specified 

mastic surface treatment for Item Nos. 18-002-05, 06, 07, and 

08 Total:

- - No Bid No Bid - - - - 0.32$                         165,160.96$            - - - -

Base Bid

Alternate No. 1

Alternate No. 2

Alternate No. 3

Alternate No. 4

Alternate No. 5

Alternate No. 6

Mastic Surface Treatment Fuquay, Inc. Clark Construction of Texas, Inc. JP Paving Co, Inc. Wagner Materials & Construction Andale Construction

-

City of Helotes 2018 Street Improvement Projects

35,782.11$                                                     -

33,472.95$                                                     -

Total Bid

No bid 507,208.62$                                                   No bid No bid 70,116.32$                                                     No bid

Interstate Barricades & Markings, Inc.

Alternate No. 1

No Bid 165,160.96$                                                   

31,044.93$                                                     -

No Bid 664,260.80$                                                   

TRP Construction Group, LLC

No bid

Alternate No. 2

Alternate No. 3

Alternate No. 4

Alternate No. 5

Alternate No. 6

8,086.89$                                                       



Item No. Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension Unit Price Bid Item Extension

18-003-00 - LS Insurance - - - - - - - - -$                           -$                           5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 

18-003-01 - LS Mobilization - - - - - - - - 20,000.00$              20,000.00$              10,000.00$              10,000.00$              

18-003-02 - LS Traffic Control - - - - - - - - -$                           -$                           5,000.00$                 5,000.00$                 

18-003-03 45,984 LF Thermoplastic Pavement Markings (Broken down below): - - - - - - - -

18-003-03a 7,887 LF
Circle A Trl., in its entirety; 4" double yellow centerline; two-

lane, two-way roadway w/o shoulders
- - - - - - - - 1.20$                         9,464.40$                 1.62$                         12,776.94$              

18-003-03b 3,526 LF

Leslie Rd. from its intersection with Bandera Rd. to its 

intersection with Rainbow Ridge; left to Tractor Supply rear 

property line; four-lane, divided / turn lane roadway w/ 

shoulders; stop bars; crosswalks; and right/left arrows 

- - - - - - - - 1.50$                         5,289.00$                 1.62$                         5,712.12$                 

18-003-03c 4,831 LF

Scenic Loop Rd. from its intersection with Old

Bandera Rd. to its intersection with Whip-o-Will Way; 4” 

double yellow centerline; two-lane, two-way roadway w/ 

shoulders; stop bars 

- - - - - - - - 1.20$                         5,797.20$                 1.62$                         7,826.22$                 

18-003-03d 8,837 LF
Antonio Dr. in its entirety; 4” double yellow centerline; two-

lane, two-way roadway w/o shoulders
- - - - - - - - 1.20$                         10,604.40$              1.62$                         14,315.94$              

18-003-03e 10,013 LF

Riggs Rd., Old Bandera Rd., and Antonio Dr., in their 

entirety, and Floore Dr. from its intersection with Bandera 

Rd. to its intersection with Old Bandera Rd.; 4” double yellow 

centerline; two-lane, two-way roadway w/ shoulders; 

perpendicular, parallel, and diagonal parking spaces; stop 

bars; crosswalks; and handicapped parking spaces / areas

- - - - - - - - 3.30$                         33,042.90$              1.62$                         16,221.06$              

18-003-03f 3,253 LF

Parrigin Rd. from its intersection with F.M. 1560 to

10928 Parrigin Rd.; 4” double yellow centerline;

two-lane, two-way roadway w/o shoulders; stop bars 

- - - - - - - - 1.20$                         3,903.60$                 1.62$                         5,269.86$                 

18-003-03g 6,543 LF

Iron Horse Way from its intersection with FM 1560 to 13784 

Iron Horse Way; 4” double yellow centerline; two-lane, two-

way roadway w/o shoulders; hatched island area; crosswalks; 

right arrow / “only”; solid white turn lane line 

- - - - - - - - 2.74$                         17,927.82$              1.62$                         10,599.66$              

18-003-03h 1,094 LF

Marnoch Rd. from its intersection with Scenic Loop Rd. to its 

intersection with Cash Mountain Rd.; 4” double yellow 

centerline; two-lane, two-way roadway w/o shoulders

- - - - - - - - 1.22$                         1,334.68$                 1.62$                         1,772.28$                 

18-003-03(a-h) 45,984 LF Thermoplastic Pavement Markings Total: - - - - - - - - 107,364.00$            1.62$                         74,494.08$              

Base Bid

City of Helotes 2018 Street Improvement Projects

Total Bid

No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 107,364.00$                                                   

Interstate Barricades & Markings, Inc.Thermoplastic Road Striping Fuquay, Inc. Clark Construction of Texas, Inc. JP Paving Co, Inc. Wagner Materials & Construction Andale Construction

94,494.08$                                                     

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

-

TRP Construction Group, LLC


